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Russ Gregory

From: Russ Gregory [russ@gregorydesigngroup.net]
Sent: November-28-17 7:53 AM

To: "Tony Tan'

Ce: ‘Russ Gregory'

Subject: RE: FW; B/29/16 - 28 Aileen Road

1- | need to get the TAPP (tree protection) completed. I've already contacted my Arborist because yours didn’t respond.
it wili be a small cost plan her Report. (ltems 5,6 & 7)

2- The “draft transfer” documents are in the file, just not seen by Carlson. {ltem 2}

3- The two payments need to be made {ltems 4, 8 & 9)

4- Clearance of the Tax Bill (just before finalizing the details).

5- The City needs to complete the Development Agreement. (item 14)

6- The 15" condition was taken care of yday.

There's not a lot of work left to secure the Severance. | think it would be wise to see it thru and get it completed...

From: Tony Tan [mailto:ttttonytarm@gmail.com]
Sent: November-27-17 7:43 PM

To: Russ Gregory

Suhject: Re: FW: Bf29/16 - 28 Aileen Road

Hi Russ, totally understand what is the process right now. However, it seems like we do have lots of works to
do. From your experience, how long is it gonna be took for finishing all the conditions?

Russ Gregory <russ@gregorydesigngroup.net>F2017F11 H27H B—FF4475E :

Tony. here's what's lefi to get the severance done at Aileen...

From: Tsang, Carison [mailto:CTsang@markham.ca]
Sent: November-27-17 2:55 PM
To: Russ Gregory

. Subject: B/29/16 - 28 Aileen Road

Hi Russ,

After my preliminary review, it appears the conditions highlighted in red below remain outstanding. Please let me know if
you have any questions. Thanks.

Condition 1 - Cleared

Condition 2- Provide draft fransfer



- Condition 3 — Cleared

Condition 4 — Conveyance Fee $ 1838.50

Candition 5,6,7 — Tree Conditions- the arborist report needs to be updated lo reflect the new driveway configuration
Conditior: 8,9 — Parkiand Dedication § 41,250

Condition 10,11,12,13 — Cleared

. Condition 14 — Deveiopment Agreemeni- In Frocess

Condition 15 - Please submit a site plan fo reflect the new driveway configuration

Carlson Tsang

Planner | — Zoning and Special Projects
- 101 Town Centre Boulevard

| Markham, Ontario L3R W3

Phone: 905-477-7000, Ext 2945

| Fax: 805-479-7768

- Ctsang@markham.ca

VARKHAM
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,jL
R

oy
s

&

vk ovn

19¢1.2017 | celebrates Canada 150

This e-mail contains information that may be privileged and/or confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, any disclosure, distribution, copying or any other use of this e-mail or the information contained

= herein or attached hereto is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this e-mail in error,
please notify this sender immediately and delete this e-mail withowt reading, printing, copying or forwarding it
- to anyone. Thank you for your co-operation,

2



65M-~2108

PART 2] PLAM B8R-TTI8

[}

— N,
N

" —

STE GRADME PLAN OF
PART OF LOT 11, REGISTENED PLAN 1382
QTY OF WARKHAM -
PEQIOHAL MUMICIPALTTY OF YORK
) A
L ]

[ 2
mﬁ-ﬂ"-m".l"--.
AR XE & 30 AR l‘“
RN . T
AR B FLE 1 mo
e .
= § D

Ry S - O R BT L v—
== § e
Rt Ao
fEEE S0
o ety [ o e
T AERELEY -
O w—— —— I
T4 wem ey B
—— P g
el
UNEERINANG SEHWES -
e e L L o]

& EL St S S— s o S o I .
A S, — —
& i mas S PR S Yy S P SRR

ATE
e i A N i W RIS W W T W Syt mAm—
gy ey LT o Pk WYL, 40 LY I WY
et 20w e o LIGPEE 1 FRfE Rk Tiks O e M &
oo JTE 130 7 T e b "

Frmrremzshmsmanmens—

| swarvows
AL Mt ooy T P TR e I 0 000 AT S ¥
DT e b —




Russ Gregory

From: l.arbi, Michael [mlarbi@markham.ca]

Sent: November-27-17 8:32 AM

To: Russ Gregory

Subject: RE: SEVERANCE FOR 28 AILEEN RD...C OF A APP Bf29/16
Hi Russ:

| have informed Carison that Engineering conditions are cleared.

Thanks.

Michael Larbi, CET.

Engineering Technologist | Engineering
Anthony Roman Centre | City of Markham
101 Town Centre Boulevard

Markham, ON L3R W3

T: 805.477.,7000 Ext. 3746
F: 905.479.7773

E: miarbi@markham.ca
www.markham.ca

From: Russ Gregory [mailto:russ@gregorydesigngroup.net)
Sent: Monday, November 27, 2017 6:41 AM

To: Larbi, Michael <mlarbi@markham.ca>

Subject: RE: SEVERANCE FOR 28 AILEEN RD...C OF A APP B/29/16

Micheal, I'm just checking with you to make sure you were OK with the drawings submitted last week.
Have your approvals been passed on the C of A so conditions 10 and 11 are cleared?

thanks

(VIARKHAM

nect ith us
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1267.201 /vgelebrates Conada i50

This e-mail contains information that may be privileged and/or confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, any disclosure, distribution, copying or any other use of this e-mail or the information contained
herein or attached hereto is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this e-mail in error,
please notify this sender immediately and delete this e-mail without reading, printing, copying or forwarding it
to anyone. Thank you for your co-operation.




